
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
Board of Trustees Meeting 

 
Bar Nunn Elementary School 

2050 Siebke Drive 
Bar Nunn, WY 82601 

 
October 25, 2010 

 
I. Executive Session – 5:00 p.m.   
 
II. School Update– 6:00 p.m. 
 
III. Regular Session – 7:30 p.m.   

A. Pledge of Allegiance  
B. Persons Requesting to Address the Board (three minute maximum) 
C. Approval of Minutes of the Board of Trustees’ General and Executive Sessions of October 11, 2010 
D. Consent Calendar Items 

1. Personnel Item – Certified and Classified Personnel Report    
2. Business and Financial Items 

a. Bills of October 15 and 22, 2010 
b. 2010-11 Applications for Reimbursement for Private Transportation of Isolated 

Student 
c. Bid Approval – Promethean Boards/Projectors/Installation 
d. Bid Ratification - Fire Suppression – Westwood Elementary  

 
IV. Reports and Recommendations 
 A. 2011-12 District Calendar – Second Reading 
 B. Recalibration Report 
 C. Education Jobs Fund Report 
 
V. Trustee Comments 
 
VI. Other Business 
 A. Next Board Meeting – November 8, 2010, 7:30 p.m., Central Services Facility 

 
VII. Adjournment 



 

 
 
 
 

Minutes of the Board of Trustees 
October 11, 2010 

 

Chairman Steve Degenfelder called the Board of Trustees of Natrona County School District Number 
One Work Session to order at 5:09 p.m. on October 11, 2010, at Central Services Facility, 970 N. Glenn 
Road, Casper, WY, 82601. 
 
Members Present: Steve Degenfelder, Audrey Cotherman, Todd Ingram, Donn McCall, Shannon 

Jackett, Suzanne Sandoval, Jim Bush, and Rita Walsh.  
 
Member Absent: Elizabeth Horsch. 
 
Others Present: Superintendent Joel Dvorak; Associate Superintendent for Human Resource 

Services, Crystal Mueller; Executive Director for Human Resource Services, Kelly 
Hornby; Associate Superintendent for Facilities and Technology, Mark Antrim; 
Executive Director for Facilities and Technology, Dennis Bay; Associate 
Superintendent for Curriculum and Instruction, Mark Mathern; Executive Director 
for Curriculum and Instruction, Mike Bond; Associate Superintendent for Business 
Services, Steve Hopkins, and Board Counsel Kathleen Dixon. 

 
Trustee Shannon Jackett moved to go into Executive Session to discuss legal, personnel, and property 
issues.  The motion was seconded by Trustee Suzanne Sandoval and carried unanimously.  Trustees 
adjourned the Executive Session at 5:37 p.m. 
 
GENERAL SESSION:  The General Session was called to order at 7:33 p.m., with the same Trustees 
attending.  Trustee Elizabeth Horsch was absent.  Those present stood for the Pledge of Allegiance.  
 
Persons Requesting to Address Trustees 
Greg Turbirdy, 2970 Pheasant Drive, Casper, WY; speaking in support of changes to weight limits in 
the middle school football program.   
 
Kimberly Holloway, 2068 S. Cedar Street, Casper, WY; invited all Trustees to the League of Women 
Voters School Board Candidate Forum on Wednesday, October 13, 2010 at 7:30 p.m.  In addition, Ms. 
Holloway indicated her support for year round schooling for all students.   
 
Toni Patik, 4810 21st Street, Casper, WY; speaking in support of funding the Eastside Activity Complex 
and noted that a strong, supportive parent group that will be actively engaged in fundraising efforts.   
 
Recognition 
Trustees recognized the 2010-11 Foreign Exchange Students and their host families.  In addition, 
Trustees congratulated Julie Bigler on her National School Nurse Certification.   
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Approval of Minutes 
Trustee Shannon Jackett moved to accept the General Session minutes of September 27, 2010.  The 
motion was seconded by Trustee Audrey Cotherman and carried unanimously. 
 
Trustee Shannon Jackett moved to accept the Executive Session minutes of September 27, 2010.  The 
motion was seconded by Trustee Todd Ingram and carried unanimously. 
 
Consent Calendar  
Superintendent Dvorak recommended the Board of Trustees accept the Consent Calendar items as 
follows (incorporating by reference the Superintendent’s recommendations attached): 
1. Personnel Item – Certified and Classified Personnel Report    
2. Business and Financial Items 

a. Bills of October 1 and 8, 2010 
b. 2010-11 Applications for Reimbursement for Private Transportation of Isolated Students 
c. Grant Award – Wy Department of Education/School Improvement Grant for RHS 
d. Bid Ratification – Paving for Westwood Elementary 

 
Trustee Suzanne Sandoval moved to accept the Consent Calendar items noted above.  The motion was 
seconded by Trustee Rita Walsh.     
 
Mike Bond, Executive Director for Curriculum and Instruction, reported that the District has selected the 
Hope Foundation as its external partner for the Roosevelt High School Improvement Grant.  Grant funds 
will be used for professional development and coaching for leadership, utilizing data, support for the 
SPARKS program, visiting successful schools, motivating and rewarding staff for improved student 
results, purchase of equipment, and funding for an instructional facilitator, tutor, and program facilitator 
at Roosevelt High School during the grant period.   
 
Trustee Donn McCall clarified that the District has changed its approach to reporting drop outs at the 
District’s high schools.  In the past, they were included in Roosevelt’s data.  Moving forward, drop outs 
will remain enrolled at their home schools.   
 
Trustee Audrey Cotherman inquired as to the sustainability of the new program at Roosevelt.  Mark 
Mathern, Associate Superintendent for Curriculum and Instruction, stated that, in year two and three of 
the grant, conversations will revolve around sustainable.  It was noted that this program could be a seed 
for implementation at the new high school and other schools.   
 
Trustee Shannon Jackett inquired as to the use of the Hope Foundation as an external partner.  Mr. 
Mathern reported that one of the grant requirements is that the District must partner with an external 
partner with proven practices.  The Hope Foundation has had many successes, including increased 
graduation and achievement rates in Fort Wayne, IN, New York, NY; and Pennsylvania.  The external 
partner will also help with the project’s fidelity and sustainability.   
 
Trustee Cotherman inquired whether there were new positions on the personnel report.  Crystal Muller, 
Associate Superintendent for Human Resource Services, stated that the Elementary Library Media 
Technician at Summit Elementary was a new position.   
 
Trustee Rita Walsh stated that she liked that the new position was working directly with students.  
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Trustee Donn McCall requested rubrics or a process be implemented to measure effectiveness of new 
positions and action plan for sustainability.   
 
The motion carried unanimously.   
 
Reports and Recommendations 
2011-12 District Calendar – First Reading 
Superintendent Joel Dvorak recommended the Board of Trustees review, on first reading, revisions to 
the 2011-12 District Calendar. 
 
Trustee Rita Walsh thanked the community for its input.  This year’s calendar process was completed in 
a timely manner with the committee agreeing to review yearly with adjustments if needed.  
 
Trustee Suzanne Sandoval stated that the District needs to systematically, and purposefully, discuss 
parking lot items.   
 
Trustee Donn McCall thanked Trustees Walsh, Jackett, and Sandoval for their hard work.  Trustee 
McCall expressed concern regarding the effect that the recalibration process will have on professional 
development, instructional facilitators, and the District’s calendar.  
 
Trustee Audrey Cotherman complimented Trustee Walsh for her leadership and indicated that it is a 
wonderful example of an adhoc committee addressing a specific problem.  
 
It was noted that no action was required at this time. 
 
WSBA Resolutions Process 
Trustee Shannon Jackett reported that the Wyoming School Board Association Directors met last 
weekend.  There are nine resolutions that will come before delegates at the WSBA annual fall 
conference.  One resolution moving forward will be the request to change the law to allow school bus 
cameras to photograph the license plate and issue citations to those that illegally pass school buses.  
 
Superintendent Joel Dvorak reported he would be more than happy to assist Trustees if they wish to 
bring resolutions to the fall conference.    
 
Eastside Athletic Complex – Phase I 
Trustee Donn McCall reported that the Board Budget Development Committee reviewed, and 
recommended funding, for Phase I of the East Casper Activity Complex at its meeting earlier today.  
Phase I of the complex will include earthwork, grading, soccer fields with synthetic turf, a concrete 
pathway, sodding, and irrigation.  It was noted that the location would be unsuitable for school facility 
construction.   
 
Extensive discussion by Trustees followed regarding fundraising efforts and commitment, District’s 
responsibility to fund entire Phase I project if fundraising efforts fail, excellent opportunity for a 
private/public cooperative venture, request to report back in January on fundraising efforts, and creating 
an account for future maintenance or replacement.   
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Trustee Donn McCall moved to approve the commencement and funding of Phase I of the Eastside 
Activity Complex at Kelly Walsh High School in the amount of $2,710,325, with $2,010,325 being 
funded from board priority one-time funds and $700,000 being raised by the Kelly Walsh High School 
parent fundraising committee.  In addition, the project will proceed with completion of bid documents 
and bid award process.  Kelly Walsh High School parent fundraising committee will provide a report to 
Trustees at its second meeting in January, 2011 on fundraising efforts.  The motion was seconded by 
Rita Walsh.  After brief discussion, the motion carried unanimously.   
 
District Improvement Plan Update  
Superintendent Joel Dvorak reported that the district is doing a lot of great work around improving 
student results, alignment around essential curriculum, and accountability for teachers and leadership.   
 
Crystal Mueller, Associate Superintendent for Human Resource Services, and Mark Mathern, Associate 
Superintendent for Curriculum & Instruction, provided a district improvement update.  Over the last 
year, leadership has been working on a district continuous improvement model.  Its components include 
leadership awareness and commitment, partner orientation, strategic alignment, operational planning and 
deployment, learning to lead high performing systems, creating technical support, and assessment of 
system performance.   
 
Trustee Comments 
Trustee Shannon Jackett inquired as to the purpose behind the District’s athletic programs.  It is a 
question that Trustees might want to discuss further.   
 
Trustee Audrey Cotherman expressed excitement over the new teacher evaluation process and district 
improvement plans.   
 
Trustee Rita Walsh thanked Trustees for the first reading of the 2011-12 District calendar revisions and 
approval of phase I of Eastside Activity Complex.   
 
Trustee Suzanne Sandoval requested that Trustees discuss the District providing IB at lower levels and a 
gifted and talented program in the middle and high schools.  Trustee Sandoval thanked Doreen McGlade 
for facilitating the calendar committee discussion.  In addition, Trustee Sandoval would like to have an 
open, transparent discussion regarding the future of the Midwest High School, what offerings Midwest 
would benefit from with the additional high school, and its high school enrollment numbers.    
 
Trustee Donn McCall thanked Mark Antrim and the District Facilities Department, in advance, for 
providing a report on expenditures required to reopen Westwood Elementary School.  Trustee McCall 
also thanked Trustees Walsh, Sandoval, and Jackett for their hard work on revisions to the 2011-12 
calendar.   
 
Trustee Todd Ingram expressed discomfort that it is the perception that Trustees act on an adhoc basis.  
Trustee Ingram stated that the District must have a comprehensive vision and its use of board priority 
funds.  It will allow the District and the community to know what it is giving up with using these funds.   
 
Trustee Jim Bush thanked Chairman Degenfelder of his recent editorial in the Casper Star Tribune.  
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Other Business 
Dr. Dvorak stated that next Board meeting will be on October 25, 2010, at Bar Nunn Elementary 
School, 2050 Siebke Drive, Bar Nunn, WY at 7:30 p.m.  In addition, PAWS results were released by the 
Wyoming Department of Education.  The District’s assessment office in the process of putting together 
data and then the District will move forward with its annual data review.  
 
Adjournment 
There being no further business to come before the Board of Trustees, Chairman Steve Degenfelder 
adjourned the meeting 9:23 p.m.  
 
 
__________________________________  __________________________________ 
Chairman      Clerk 
 



  

 
 
 

 
TO:  Board of Trustees 
 
FROM: Dr. Joel Dvorak 
 
DATE:  October 25, 2010 
   
SUBJECT: Personnel Items 
 
RECOMMENDATION:     I recommend that the Board approve the following requests: 
I. Employment of the Following: 
 A. Teacher/Administrator  

Calvin Colling, (Assoc. of Applied Science in Culinary Arts, The Art Institute of 
Colorado, Denver, CO, 6/00)  1 FTE Pro Start Teacher at Transitions, 8/4/10  
Manford Hurley, (B.S. in Industrial Technology, University of Wyoming, Laramie, WY, 
5/10) 1 FTE Career Technical Education Teacher at NCHS, 8/4/10 
Linda Olsen, (B.A. in Elementary Education, University of Wyoming, Laramie, WY, 
5/10) OYO 1 FTE Fifth Grade Teacher at Willard, 8/4/10 
Lydia Rush, (B.A, in Elementary Education, University of Wyoming, Laramie, WY, 
5/10) 1 FTE First Grade Teacher at Verda James, 8/4/10 
 

B.        Classified 
  Ruby Perry, Office Assistant/Student Monitor at Fort Caspar Academy, 9/22/10 
   
II. Promotions/Transfers 

A. Teacher/Administrator  
None 
 

B. Classified    
Amber Brown, from Custodian I at Cottonwood to Lunch Server/Student Monitor at 
Cottonwood, 10/4/10 
Cynthia Deal, from Cafeteria Worker at Fort Caspar Academy to Custodian I at Willard, 
9/13/10 
Brandy Friesen, from Special Education Instructional Assistant II at CJH to Special 
Education Instructional Assistant II at KWHS, 9/27/10 
Deborah Scranton, from Student Monitor at Fort Caspar Academy to Laundry Worker for 
the District at Woods, 10/11/10 
 

IV. Resignations/Terminations 
A. Teacher/Administrator 

None 
 

B. Classified 
Barbara Barnum, District Classified Substitute, 10/5/10 
Sandra Beckstead, District Certified Substitute, 5/20/10 
Cynthia Deal, Custodian I at Willard, 9/21/10 

  



 
 
 

  

Jill Mullan, Office Assistant/Records Clerk at RHS, 10/8/10 
James Skommesa, District Certified Substitute, 9/10/10 
 

V. Retirements 
 A. Teacher/Administrator 
  None 
 
 B. Classified 
  Ora Spaulding, Custodian I for Plant Operations/Maintenance at CSF, 10/14/10 



 
 
 
 

 
 

 
 

TO:  Board of Trustees 
 
FROM: Dr. Joel Dvorak, Superintendent 
 
DATE:  October 25, 2010 
 
SUBJECT: Promethean Boards/Projectors/Installation 
 
               
 
RECOMMENDATION:  In accordance with Board Policy, the following summary of bids which 
have been opened  by the Purchasing Department,  are submitted and recommended for approval 
by the Board of Trustees. 
 
  CDW Government LLC/Vernon Hills, IL     
   Promethean Boards      $ 1,247.00 ea 
   Promethean ActivArena     $    143.00 ea 
                                 Promethean Pen                                             $      76.60 set 
   Promethean ActivSlate     $     287.00 ea 
   Promethean ActivRemote     $       76.80 ea 
   Promethean Active Wand     $       75.84 ea 
 
  Computer Village/Rapid City, SD 
   Promethean Board Installation      $    540.00 ea 
   Third Party Mounting System    $   150.00 ea 
 
  Haddock Corp/Wichita, KS 
   Promethean ActiveVote     $ 1,550.00 set 
   Promethean ActivExpression    $ 2,319.00 set 
 
  Troxell Communications/Cheyenne, WY 
   Hitachi Series Projector      $    988.00 ea 
   Replacement Bulb for Projector     $    299.00 ea 
   Price to Remove and Reinstall 
    Existing Promethean Boards   $     475.00 ea 
   Premier Mount for Projector      $    192.00 ea 
 
  Track Technology Systems/Fishers, IN 
   Diversitrack Sliding Track Mounting  $     379.00 ea 
   Diversitrack Stationery Mounting   $     239.00 ea 
 



RATIONALE: I recommend that low bid be accepted on the Promethean Boards, Projectors and 
Installation. 
 
  Promethean Boards 
  (Quantity to be ordered 15-150 between 10/15/10 and 10/5/11.) 
   CDW Government LLC/Vernon Hills,IL 
    Recommended Award     $1,247.00 ea 
   Haddock Corp/Wichita, KS        1,350.00 ea 
   Computer Village/Rapid City, SD – No Bid      
                       Troxel Communications – No Bid 
 
  Promethean ActiveVote 
   Haddock Corp/Wichita, KS      $ 1,550.00 ea 
    Recommended Award 
   CDW Government LLC/Vernon Hills, IL       1,807.00 ea 
   Computer Village/Rapid City, SD – No Bid      
                       Troxel Communications – No Bid 
 
  Promethean ActivExpression 
   Haddock Corp/Wichita, KS      $ 2,319.00 ea 
    Recommended Award 
   CDW Government LLC/Vernon Hills, IL       2,415.00 ea  
  Computer Village/Rapid City, SD – No Bid      
                       Troxel Communications – No Bid 
 
  Promethean ActivArena 
   CDW Government LLC/Vernon Hills, IL               $    143.00 ea 
    Recommended Award 
   Haddock Corp/Wichita, KS             151.00 ea 
   Computer Village/Rapid City, SD – No Bid      
                       Troxel Communications – No Bid 
 
  Promethean ActivPen 
   CDW Government LLC/Vernon Hills, IL               $     76.60 ea 
    Recommended Award 
   Haddock Corp/Wichita, KS              78.00 ea 
   Computer Village/Rapid City, SD – No Bid      
                       Troxel Communications – No Bid 
 
  Promethean ActivSlate 
   CDW Government LLC/Vernon Hills, IL               $    287.00 ea 
    Recommended Award 
   Haddock Corp/Wichita, KS       $    295.00 ea 
   Computer Village/Rapid City, SD – No Bid      
   Troxel Communications – No Bid 
 
  Promethean ActivRemote 
   CDW Government LLC/Vernon Hills, IL               $     76.80 ea 
    Recommended Award 
   Haddock Corp/Wichita, KS              84.00 ea 
   Computer Village/Rapid City, SD – No Bid      



   Troxel Communications – No Bid 
 
  Promethean ActivWand 
   CDW Government LLC/Vernon Hills, IL               $    75.84 ea 
    Recommended Award 
                       Haddock Corp/Wichita, KS             83.00 ea 
   Computer Village/Rapid City, SD – No Bid      
   Troxel Communications/Cheyenne, WY – No Bid 
  
  Promethean Board Installation 
   Computer Village/Rapid City, SD      $   540.00 ea 
    Recommended Award 
   Troxel Communications                695.00 ea  
 
  Cost to Remove and Reinstall Existing Promethean Boards 
   Troxel Communications/Cheyenne, WY           $   475.00 ea 
     Recommended Award  
   Computer Village/Rapid City, SD             500.00 ea 
 
  Third Party Mounting System 
   Computer Village/Rapid City, SD      $   150.00 ea 
    Recommended Award 
   Haddock Corp/Wichita, KS – No Bid 
   Troxel Communication/Cheyenne, WY – No Bid  
 
  Hitachi Series Projector 
   Troxell Communications/Cheyenne, WY       $    988.00 ea 
    Recommended Award 
   Haddock Corp/Wichita, KS            1,399.00 ea 
 
  Replacement Bulb for Projector 
   Troxell Communications/Cheyenne, WY       $    299.00 ea 
    Recommended Award 
   Haddock Corp/Wichita, KS  - No Bid 
   
  Premier Mount 
   Troxell Communications/Cheyenne, WY       $    192.00 ea 
    Recommended Award 
   CDW Government LLC/Vernon Hills, IL    215.74 ea 
   Haddock Corp/Wichita, KS – No Bid 
   Computer Village/Rapid city, SD – No Bid 
 
  Diversitrack Sliding Mounting System 
   Track Technology Systems/Fishers, IN        $    379.00 ea 
    Recommended Award 
   No Other Bids 
 
  Diversitrack Stationery Mounting System 
   Track Technology Systems/Fishers, IN        $    239.00 ea 
    Recommended Award 
   No Other Bids 



 
 
 
TO:  Board of Trustees 
 
FROM: Joel Dvorak, Superintendent 
 
DATE: October 25, 2010 
 
RE:  Bid Award for Westwood Elementary School Fire Suppression System 
 
 
RECOMMENDATION:  I recommend the Board of Trustees award the bid for the Westwood 
Elementary School Fire Suppression System to Rapid Fire Protection, Inc. in the amount of 
$97,923.00. 
 
RATIONALE:  The project was advertised and the following companies submitted a bid: 
 
Company  Amount of Bid 
Rapid Fire Protection, Inc., Rapid City SD $   97,923.00 
Western States Fire Protection, Black Hawk, SD $ 112,800.00 
 
The bids were reviewed by Bret Benes, Caspar/Pope Joint Venture Project Manager, Keith Brown, 
District Project Manager, and Jak Peden-Hollinger, Engineering Design Associates Mechanical 
Engineer. 
 
The recommendation is to award the bid for the Westwood Elementary School Fire Suppression 
System to Rapid Fire Protection, Inc. in the amount of $97,923.00. 
 
Major Maintenance Funding for the Westwood Elementary School Fire Suppression System project 
has been approved by the Wyoming School Facilities Commission. 
 
 



 
 
 
 
 
 
 
TO:   Board of Trustees 
 
FROM:  Dr. Joel Dvorak, Superintendent 
 
DATE:  October 25, 2010 
 
SUBJECT: Revisions to 2011-12 District Calendar – Second Reading  
 
              
 
RECOMMENDATION:  I recommend that the Board of Trustees approve, on second reading, 
revisions to the 2011-12 District Calendar. 
 
RATIONALE:  On September 15, 2010, an ad hoc committee of trustees, cabinet members, 
principals, teachers, classified staff members and parents met to review revisions to the 2011-12 
District Calendar. The committee was charged with narrow parameters for calendar changes, 
which included trying to delay the start date in the fall, reviewing winter break and the Winter 
Bridges program, and maintaining balance between the first and second semesters. The 
committee also had to work within parameters such as state law, which requires a minimum of 
175 contact days with students each year, and the work agreement for teachers, which stipulates 
a 188-day work year.  
 
The revisions would be for the 2011-12 school year only. That is the last year of the currently 
approved five-year cycle of calendars. A similar process will take place annually as part of the 
continuous improvement model to develop each year's calendar the previous spring. 
 



9/15/10
3:11 PM

2011-2012 Calendar
Worksheet Only

 Ad Hoc Calendar Committee
Concensus on 9/15/2010

T E S School Day Calendar Calendar Summary by Date Starting Dates
12 6 6 Aug 9- New Faculty Report To School Aug 9 - New Teachers

1 2 3 4 5 Aug 15 - New Teacher Breakfast Aug 16 - All Certified staff
8 9 10 11 12 Aug 16 - 188 Day Certified Staff Report- Management Day Aug 24 - All Students

4 15 16 17 18 19 Aug 17,18,19, 22  -  Professional Development Days 
5 3 3 22 23 24 25 26 Aug 23 - Teacher Self Directed Day Student/Teacher Instruc Days

3 3 3 29 30 31 Aug 24- Classes begin 
21 21 21 Full Day 175 175

2 2 2 1 2 Half Day 0 0

4 4 4 5 6 7 8 9 Sept 5- Labor Day, no school
5 5 5 12 13 14 15 16

5 5 5 19 20 21 22 23 Total 175 175

5 5 5 26 27 28 29 30

21 20 20 Oct 21 - 1st quarter ends - 42 days Student half day count as

5 5 5 3 4 5 6 7 full student instruction days

5 5 5 10 11 12 13 14

5 5 5 17 18 19 20 21         Parent/Teacher Conferences Quarter & Semester Days

5 4 4 24 25 26 27 28 Oct 24 - Jr. & Sr. Highs dismissed all day 1st Quarter 42
1 1 1 31 Oct 24 Elem dismissed all day 2nd Quarter 40

19 19 19 First Semester 82
4 4 4 1 2 3 4 3rd Quarter 39
5 5 5 7 8 9 10 11 4th Quarter 54
5 5 5 14 15 16 17 18 Second Semester 93
2 2 2 21 22 23 24 25 Nov 23,24,25 - Thanksgiving vacation, no school Total 175
3 3 3 28 29 30

16 16 16 Dec 22- 2nd quarter ends -  82 days Extra Teacher Days E S
2 2 2  1 2      Management Day 1 1
5 5 5 5 6 7 8 9    .   August 16
5 5 5 12 13 14 15 16 Self Directed Days
4 4 4 19 20 21 22 23 Dec 23 -Jan 2 - Winter Break for teachers     August 23rd 1 1
0 0 0 26 27 28 29 30 Dec 23 -Jan 3 - Winter Break for  students May 29 1 1

20 19 19 Professional Dev 7 7
4 3 3 2 3 4 5 6 Jan 3 - Professional Development Day  Aug 17,18,19,22
5 5 5 9 10 11 12 13 Jan. 4 - Second Semester begins Jan 3, Feb 16,17
4 4 4 16 17 18 19 20 Jan 16 - Martin Luther King Day, no school PT Conferences 2 2
5 5 5 23 24 25 26 27   Oct 24th 
2 2 2 30 31   Feb 20

21 18 18 Flex Day 1 1
3 3 3 1 2 3 Feb 16 & 17 - Professional Development Day
5 5 5 6 7 8 9 10         Parent/Teacher Conferences Total 13 13
5 3 3 13 14 15 16 17 Feb. 20 - Jr. & Sr. Highs dismissed all day 
5 4 4 20 21 22 23 24 Feb 20 - Elementary dismissed all day Elementary and Secondary

3 3 3 27 28 29 have 1.0 flex day - which is

17 17 17 contract time to be used

2 2 2 1 2 outside the scheduled work

0 0 0 5 6 7 8 9 Mar 2 - 3rd Quarter Ends - 39 Days day to complete required work

5 5 5 12 13 14 15 16 Mar 5- 9  Spring Break, no school
5 5 5 19 20 21 22 23 Holiday & Release Days

5 5 5 26 27 28 29 30 Labor Day 1

20 20 20 Thanksgiving 3

5 5 5 2 3 4 5 6 Winter Break - Teachers 6

5 5 5 9 10 11 12 13 Winter Break  - students 7

5 5 5 16 17 18 19 20 April 27 - Good Friday, no school Martin Luther King Day 1

4 4 4 23 24 25 26 27 Spring Break 5

1 1 1 30 Good Friday 1

20 19 19 May 25 - 4th quarter ends - 93 days  Memorial Day 1

4 4 4 1 2 3 4                 
5 5 5 7 8 9 10 11 May 28 - Memorial Day, no school
5 5 5 14 15 16 17 18 May 29 -SCI Day (or snow-day makeup if necessary) Graduation Dates

5 5 5 21 22 23 24 25 Management Day
1 0 0 28 29 30 31 KWHS -     Fri May 18     7:00 pm

1 Flex Day teachers Professional Development Days NCHS -     Sat May 19     3:00 pm
1 RHS   -     Sat May 19     7:00 pm

4 5 6 7 8 Self Directed Day Midwest  -Sun May 20     2:00 pm
11 12 13 14 15

Make-up Snow Day Pay Day Days Counted

T = Teacher
Holiday/Release Days Parent/Teacher Conference E = Elementary

188.0 175.0 175.0 9/15/10 S = Secondary

JUNE 2012

FEBRUARY 2012

MARCH 2012

APRIL 2012

MAY 2012

JANUARY 2012

AUGUST 2011

SEPTEMBER 2011

OCTOBER 2011

NOVEMBER 2011

DECEMBER 2011
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